14. CIF073024PW12 APPROPRIATING $14,700 FROM DISTRICT 12 CAPITAL
INFRASTRUCTURE FUNDS TO PUBLIC WORKS FOR SIDEWALK REPAIRS AT 4305,
4307, 4511, 4513, 4609, 4613, 4615, AND 4607 FLINTLOCK DRIVE, AND 6309
FLINTLOCK CIRCLE (ON FLINTLOCK DRIVE SIDE).

7/30/24 Labor, Economic Development, and Appropriations Committee Approved

Sponsors:
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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
x Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: councilman Blackwell/District 12 |

| Amount: 14700 Date: 06/25/2024 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

Funding for sidewalk repairs at 6309 Flintlock Circle (on Flintlock Dr Side),
4607, 4615, 4613, 4609, 4513, 4511, 4307 and 4305 Flintlock pr.

City Agency: Public works
Contact Person: Thierry Muhanuka

Agency Phone: 502-574-5810

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12 (M Kk Pladkwdl 14,700 6/25/2024

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date
Approved by:
Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference#: C T F 073024 P12 ToOMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:

%e\\ Revised May 2016
Page 1
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Department/Project:
Public works/Funding for Flintlock Dr & Flintlock Circle sidewalk repairs

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

- Program/Project Name: Funding for Flintlock Dr & Flintlock Circle sidewalk repairs

Yes/No/NA
Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding? Yes
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description? : NA
- Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount? ~ NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? : NA

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville ,
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the " Yes
funding source is probably NDF. 5

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF. ~ Yes
Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. NA
Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?

- If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost? Yes
Submitted by: Heather Blazis Date: 6/25/2024

Revised May 2016
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From: Muhanuka, Thierry

To: Blazis, Heather

Cc: Haines, Matthew; Davis, Clinton

Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalks Repair Cost Estimates on Flintlock Dr
Date: Monday, June 17, 2024 2:33:49 PM

Attachments: image001.png

Public Works will accept funds to repair the sidewalks on Flintlock Dr.

Thanks,

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, June 17, 2024 2:21 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalks Repair Cost Estimates on Flintlock Dr

Ok, thank you. Then Councilman Blackwell would like to repair these. Will PW accept the
funding to repair them?

Thank you,

Heather

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell /District 12
601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
po(502) 574-1112 £ {502) 574-3363

wassas rickblarkwell com

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierrv.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, June 17, 2024 2:19 PM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky. gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew Haines@louisvilieky.gov>
Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalks Repair Cost Estimates on Flintlock Dr

The other option we have is sidewalk grinding but since these are rated 4’s and 5’s | don’t think they
would be qualified for this treating. We only grind sidewalks that have 2” or less vertical displacement.

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky, goy>

Sent: Monday, june 17, 2024 11:32 AM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalks Repair Cost Estimates on Flintlock Dr

Is there any better/cheaper way to do all of these sections instead of piece by piece? We just
wanted to check.
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Thanks,
Heather

Heather Blazis | Legisiative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell /District 12
601 W_Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202
oo {502) 574-1112 £ (502) 574-3363

veas rickblackwell com

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.muhanuka@iouisvilleky goy>
Sent: Monday, June 17, 2024 10:07 AM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather blazis@louisvilleky. sov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew. Haines@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: D12 - Sidewalks Repair Cost Estimates on Flintlock Dr

LA Blazis,

Below are the cost estimates to repair/replace the sidewalks on Flintlock Dr. Please let me know if you
have any questions.

SR# 24ENG-01556

LOCATION 4305 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 5

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x40' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,100.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 24ENG-01557

LOCATION 4307 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x20" of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# | 24ENG-01558
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4511 Flintlock Dr

LOCATION
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x40' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $2,100.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

24ENG-01559

SR#

LOCATION 4513 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x25" of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

24ENG-01560

SR#
LOCATION 4609 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x16' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.

24ENG-01561

SR#
LOCATION 4613 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x8' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will

require re-inspection.
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SR# 24ENG-01562

LOCATION 4615 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x4' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 24ENG-01564

LOCATION 4607 Flintlock Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x16’ of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

SR# 24ENG-01565

LOCATION 6309 Flintlock Cir {on Flintlock Dr side)
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis

RATE 4

DATE SENT 6/17/2024

ESTIMATE BY ™
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 4'x20' of sw, seed and protection
ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00

Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days will
require re-inspection.

Thanks,

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Monday, June 3, 2024 4:30 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierrv.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: sidewalk issues

Good afternoon, Thierry. A constituent reached out to us about multiple sidewalk issues on
Flintlock. Can we please have these areas inspected, rated and estimated?
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Thanks,
Heather

4305-4307, 4511, 4513, 4609, 4613, 4615 Flintlock Dr
6300 Doe Run Rd (on Flintlock Dr side)

They also state that due to sunken sidewalk water pools at:
4607 Flintlock Dr & 6309 Flintlock Court (Flintlock Dr side)

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell /District 12
£01 W lefferson Street | Loulsville, KY 40202
po(502) 574-1112 F(502) 574-3363

v rickblackwell com
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