CAFON1UPWIS

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
v(gfital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAYV)
| Primary Sponsor: (J€ yIv)i{ex Chan TO?E,“ |
| Amount: ‘E'(QQ , oUO. % Date: §|a| |24 ]

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s): “‘wo Sp&ci l/\umF
grojecrs n Distvict 15])Hazelwerk fve. petween

Bicknell Ave. an Blueqrass’ Ave. threc 1ol Lumes
amA  gipvmye  for § 13,2000 2) Walky Ave. et
Taylov @Qw& and Lovedale Ave. 4uov +otul (/BAMF;O
ok Sidrage for 9,920, Todal oost $# Iy OH0.

City Agency: Tublic \ovks & Assets

r

Contact Person: él‘/"ﬁ DO (W
Agency Phone: 5 T4 - 3¥ & ——
I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.
15 d42,040.%° § /3124
District # Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference # C)F Dlo(BDU QS To OMB;
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
Revised May 2016
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Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
~ Appropriating Funding?

VRequest Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

" Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, docs the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

'Fundmg Source: If CIF is ‘being requested, does Metro Louisville
- own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful

life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
85,0007 If so, an ordinance is required.

‘Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

“Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
estimate and description of cost?

gy Name Public. Works + Ascete
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Submitted by: A A4, A igm

N A

Date: 6/‘3//7’24

Revised May 2016




DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY

JENNIFER CAUMMISAR-KERN

Digector

CRAIG GREENBERC

MAYOR

TO: Councilwoman Jennifer Chappell
Louisville Metro District 15

FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: May 17,2024
RE: Cost of speed humps/signage for Hazelwood Avenue, between Bicknell Avenue and

Bluegrass Avenue.

Three (3) Speed Humps x $4,200.06 = $12,600.60
Two (2) Speed Hump signs x $260.00 = $520.00
Total = . §13,420.00

Please consider this letter as our official Statement of Cost for al] speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $4,200.00 and each sign is $260.00. Based on our
Engineering Studies, a total of three (3) speed humps and two (2) speed hump signs have been
proposed for Hazelwood Avenue, between Bicknell Avenue and Biuegrass Avenue. The total “not to
exceed” cost is $13,120.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you bave any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.
Sincerely

J f
C;b\sw

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW LOUISVILLEK Y .GOV
METRC DEVELOPMENT CENTER 444 SOUTH 5™ STREET SUITE 400 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202
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From: Dow, Gregory

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 4:11 PM

To: Luckett, Amy

Cc: Chappell, Jennifer; Bell, LaTonya J.; Brown, Jeffrey

Subject: RE: Hazelwood Elementary- Safe Routes to School Request
Hey Amy,

Public Works & Assets will accept funding in the amount of $13,120.00 for the speed hump and signage
installation project for Hazelwood Avenue, between Bicknell Avenue and Bluegrass Avenue.

Greg

From: Luckett, Amy <Amy.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 4:07 PM

To: Dow, Gregory <Greg.Dow@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Chappell, Jennifer <Jennifer.Chappell@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Hazelwood Elementary- Safe Routes to School Request

Hi, Greg,
Will you accept CiF funds from the District 15 office for speed humps on Hazelwood Ave?

Thank you!

Amy Luckett

Legislative Assistant, District 15
Louisville Metro Council

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

O: (502) 574-1115

C: (502) 409-3943
amy.lucketi@louisvilleky.gov

Subscribe to D15 News




From: Dow, Gregory <Greg. Dow@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 17, 2024 4:27 PM

To: Luckett, Amy <Amy.Luckett@louisvilieky.gov>

Cc: Chappeli, Jennifer <jennifer.Chappell@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Hazelwood Elementary- Safe Routes to School Request

Amy,
Please see attached statement of cost for Hazelwood Avenue.

Greg

From: Luckett, Amy <Amvy.Luckett@louisvilleky.pov>

Sent: Friday, February 16, 2024 10:34 AM

To: Dow, Gregory <Greg.Dow®@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Chappell, Jennifer <jepnifer.Chappell@iguisvilieky gov>
Subject: RE: Hazelwood Elementary- Safe Routes to School Request

Thank you, Greg. Do you know if there will be any additional funding opportunities with these policy changes?

We appreciate any insight you have to offer!

Amy Luckett

Legisiative Assistant, District 15
Louisville Metre Council

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

0: (502) 574-1115

C: (502) 409-3943
amyluckett@iouisvilleky.gov

Subscribe to D15 News




DEPARTMENT OF PUBLIC WORKS AND ASSETS
LOUISVILLE, RENTUCKY

CRAIGC GREENBERG JENNIFER CAUMMISAR-KERN
MAYQR Dhrector
TO: Councilwoman Jennifer Chappell
District 15
FROM: Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering
DATE: April 5, 2024
RE: Cost of speed humps/signage for Walter Avenue, between Taylor Blvd. and Lonsdale
Avenue.
Two (2} Speed Humps x $4,200.00 = $8,400.00
Two (2} Speed Hump signs x $260.00 = $520.60
Total = $8,920.00

Please consider this letter as our official statement of cost for all speed hump related work.

Each speed hump, including markings is $4,200.00 and each sign is $260.00. Based on our
Engineering Studies, a total of two (2) speed humps and two (2) speed hump signs have been proposed
for Walter Avenue, between Taylor Blvd. and Lonsdale Avenue. The total “not to exceed” cost is
$8,920.00.

Upon funding approval, the speed humps will be installed as schedule and weather permits.

Please let me know if you have any questions. You may contact me at 574-3882.

Sincerely,

N

Gregory A. Dow
Traffic Engineering

WWW.LOUISVILLEKY.GOV
METRO DEVELCPMENT CENTER 444 SQUTH 57 STREET SUITE 408 LOUISVILLE, KENTUCKY 40202
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From: Dow, Gregory

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 4:17 PM

To: Luckett, Amy

Cc: Chappell, Jennifer; Bell, LaTonya J.; Brown, Jeffrey
Subject: RE: Walter Ave

Hey Amy,

Public Works & Assets will accept District 15 CIF funding in the amount of $8,920.00 for the speed hump
and signage installation project for Walter Avenue, between Taylor Blvd. and Lonsdale Avenue.

Greg

From: Luckett, Amy <Amy.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, May 31, 2024 4:08 PM

To: Dow, Gregory <Greg.Dow®@louisvilleky.gov>

Ce: Chappell, Jennifer <Jennifer.Chappell@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya /. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisviileky.gov>
Subject: RE: Walter Ave

Greg,

Will you accept CIF funds from the District 15 office for this project?

Thank youl

Amy Luckett

Legislative Assistant, District 15
Louisville Metro Council

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

O: (502) 574-1115

C: (502) 409-3943
amy.luckett@Ilouisvilleky.qov

Subscribe to D15 News




From: Dow, Gregory <Greg.Dow@iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 5, 2024 3:07 PM

To: Luckett, Amy <Amy.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Walter Ave

Hey Amy,
Please see attached updated statement of cost for Walter Avenue.

Greg

From: Luckett, Amy <Amv.Luckett@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Friday, April 5, 2024 2:05 PM

To: Dow, Gregory <Greg. Dow®@Iouisvilleky.govs
Subject: RE: Walter Ave

Hi, Greg,
Is this speedhump estimate still good or would we need to increase the cost to reflect the new speedhump prices?

Thank youl

Amy Luckett

Legisiative Assistant, District 15
Louisville Metro Council

601 West jefferson Street
Louisville, KY 40202

C: (502) 574-1115

C: (502) 409-3943
amv.luckett@iouisviileky.gov

BLERBEL s et
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