Docusign Envelope ID: 2F35095A-6CC8-4ABC-B5F4-0C6560CA51C0

CIF073024PW12b

Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
x Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

Paving Fund (PAV)
| Primary Sponsor: Councilman Blackwell/District 12 ]

| Amount: 1500 Date: 07/17/2024 |

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
Funding for sidewalk repair at 2509 McGee Dr.

City Agency: Public works
Contact Person: Thierry Muhanuka

Agency Phone: 502-574-5810

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

12 (M Kk Plackwdl 1500 7/17/2024

District # Council Member Signature Amount Date

Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: CIF073024PW12b To OMB:
Budget Revision #:
Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:
Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
AG
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Department/Project:
PubTic works/Funding for sidewalk repair at 2509 McGee Dr.

Additional Signatures

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have determined the funds will
be used for a public purpose.

Council Member Signature and Amount
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Interagency Name: Public Works

Program/Project Name: Funding for sidewalk repair at 2509 McGee Dr.

Request Form: Is the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

| Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
account numbers in the request form description?

- Request Form: [f matching funds are to be used, does the amount of
the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
- disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than
$5,000? If so, an ordinance is required.

~Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If so, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the attachment include a valid
- estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA

Yes

NA

NA

NA

Yes

Yes

NA

No

Yes

Submitted by: Heather Blazis

Date: 7/17/2024

Revised May 2016
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From: M hier

To: Blazis, Heather

Cc: Haines, Matthew; Davis, Clinton

Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalk Repair Cost Estimate at 2509 Mcgee Dr
Date: Wednesday, July 17, 2024 7:21:22 AM

Attachments: image001.png

Public Works will accept the funding to repair the sidewalk at 2509 Mcgee Dr.

Thanks,

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, July 16, 2024 4:58 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew.Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Davis, Clinton
<Clinton.Davis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: D12 - Sidewalk Repair Cost Estimate at 2509 Mcgee Dr

Will public works accept the funding for the repair of the sidewalk at 2509 McGee?

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell/Districy 12
601 W lefferson Streer | Louisville, KY 40202
oo (502) §74-1112 £ {502} 574-3363

v rickblackwell com

From: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierry.muhanuka@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, July 10, 2024 9:21 AM

To: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky. gov>

Cc: Haines, Matthew <Matthew Haines@louisvilleky.gov>; Davis, Clinton
<Clinton.Davis@louisvilleky.goy> '

Subject: D12 - Sidewalk Repair Cost Estimate at 2509 Mcgee Dr

LA Blazis,

Below is the cost estimate to repair/replace the sidewalk at 2509 Mcgee Dr. Let me know if you have
any questions.

SR# 24ENG-01887
LOCATION 2509 Mcgee Dr
REQUESTED BY D12 - LA Blazis
RATE 5

DATE SENT 7/10/2024
ESTIMATE BY ™
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1] 1]
MEASUREMENTS/COMMENTS 10'x4" of sw

ESTIMATE AMOUNT $1,500.00
Estimate is valid for 120 days from date sent. Any requests after 120 days
will require re-inspection.

Thanks,

From: Blazis, Heather <heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, July 2, 2024 4:04 PM

To: Muhanuka, Thierry <thierrv.muhanuka@|ouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: City of Lousiville Sidewalks/Curbs Submitted

Good afternoon, Thierry. Can we please get this sidewalk inspected and an estimate for repair

please?
Thankyou,
Heather

Heather Blazis | Legislative Assistant

Office of Councilman Rick Blackwell /District 12
601 W lefferson Streer | Louisville, KY 40202
pr (5021 574-1112 £ (502) 574-3363

v rickblackwsll com

From: noreply@accela.com <noreplv@accela.com>

Sent: Monday, July 1, 2024 7:.50 PM

To: Blackwell, Rick <Rick.Blackwell@louisvilleky.gov>; Blazis, Heather
<heather.blazis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: City of Lousiville Sidewalks/Curbs Submitted

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links,
open attachments, or give away private information unless you recognize the
sender’'s email address and know the content is safe.

A new Sidewalks/Curbs Service Request: SR-SDCB-24-087975 has been entered for
Council District 12:

Description:
Sidewalk is sunken down causing a major tripping hazard. Gentlemen walking his dog
already tripped and fell dislocating his shoulder and breaking a couple ribs.

Address:
2509 MCGEE DR, LOUISVILLE, KY 40216
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Complainant:

Email Address: thucket09031972@amail.com




