Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request
® Neighborhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)
Paving Fund (PAV)

FIOF 02052500 13

[ Primary Sponsor: Councilman Dan Seum, Jr.

| Amount: $755.00

Date: January 14, 2025

Description of program/project including public purpose, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):
This will transfer $755 of District 13's Neighborhood Development Fund to Public Works to enter
into a lease agreement with LG&E for streetlights. There will be one streetlight installed on an
existing pole at Ashley Pointe Dr. and Penile Rd. The costis $12.57/month for the Type B
250Weq LED cobra head light for a 5-year lease with L.GE.

City Agency: [ ouisville Metro Public Works
Contact Person: jennifer Caummisar-Kern

Agency Phone: (502) 574-3925

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached

documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

156

$755.00 1/14/25

District # er Signature Amount Date
Approved by:

Appropriations Committee Chairman Date
Clerk’s Office & OMB Use Only:
Request Amount: Amended Amount:
Reference #: NOF020525PWVS To OMB:

Budget Revision #:

Account #:

To Project Manager:

Completion Date:

Actual Cost:

Funds Returned:

Revised May 2016
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Louisville Metro Public Works

Interagency Name:

- Program/Project Name: Streetlight at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.
‘ ' Yes/No/NA

Request Form: [s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)

~ Appropriating Funding? Yes
| Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, are they disclosed with
- account numbers in the request form description? NA
Request Form: If matching funds are to be used, does the amount of }
the request exclude the matching fund amount? NA
Request Form: If other funds are to be used for this project, are they
disclosed with account numbers in the request form description? NA
Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville
own/will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the NA
~ funding source is probably NDF.
- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful ,
life of more than one year? If not, the funding source is probably NDF-. NA
 Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than '
- $5,000? If so, an ordinance is required. No
- Ordinance Required: Is the request a transfer from NDF to cost center?
If s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less? No
“Supporting Documentation: Docs the attachment include a valid ‘
Yes

- estimate and description of cost?

Submitted by: % % WM\/

Date: ___/"__Zi/”g_zg

Revised May 2016




Ammon, Lisa E

From: Brown, Jeffrey

Sent: Wednesday, December 11, 2024 3:15 PM

To: Reed, Chad [Contractor]; Cash, Cathy

Cc: Ammon, Lisa E

Subject: RE: Streetlights at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.

Chad & Cathy,
Would it be possible to install a street light on the existing pole at Ashby Pointe Dr & Penile Rd?

Lisa,
If this pole can accommodate a new street light, the cost would be $12.57/month for the Type B 250Weq LED cobra
head light, so the NDF appropriation would need to be $755 to cover the first 5 years of the minimum 5-year lease with

LGE.




shley Pointe Mobile Home Park

Jeffrey Brown, PE

From: Ammon, Lisa E <lisa.ammon@Iouisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Thursday, October 24, 2024 10:15 AM

To: Brown, Jeffrey <Jeffrey.Brown@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Streetlights at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.

Good morning, Jeff,

| hope your week is going well.




CM Seum received a request to install streetlights at the intersection of Ashley Pointe Dr. and Penile Rd. The entrance
to Ashley Pointe mobile home park is located at that intersection and that’s where many kids wait for buses. It is very
dark at the intersection, and they would like to see lighting to improve safety at the bus stop.

Would it be possible to get quotes from LG&E on streetlight costs for the intersection?
Thank you,

Lisa

Lisa Ammon

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Dan Seum, Jr.
Metro Council District 13

601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: 502-574-1113

Lisa. Ammon@louisvilleky.gov




Ammon, Lisa E

M

From: Kern, Jennifer

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2025 9:38 AM

To: Ammon, Lisa E

Cc: Seum JR, Dan; Steele, Joshua; Keith, Stacy

Subject: RE: NDF for Streelight at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.

Yes, public works accepts

Jennifer Caummisar-Kern
Jennifer.Kern@louisvilleky.gov | (502)574-3925

From: Ammon, Lisa E <lisa.ammon@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Friday, January 17, 2025 7:41 AM

To: Kern, Jennifer <jennifer.kern@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Seum JR, Dan <Dan.Seum@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: NDF for Streelight at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.

Good morning, Director Kern,

I've processed the paperwork for the NDF transfer to Public Works for the streetlight at Ashley Pointe Dr. & Penile Rd.
The NDE transfer is in the amount of $755 for a 5-year lease with LG&E. Please see the attached paperwork.

Please let us know if Public Works is willing to accept the funding.
Thank you,
Lisa

Lisa Ammon

Legislative Assistant
Councilman Dan Seum, Jr.
Metro Council District 13

601 W. Jefferson St.
Louisville, KY 40202

Office: 502-574-1113
Lisa.Ammon@Ilouisvilleky.gov




