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Louisville Metro Council City Agency Request PER 0-090-25

X Neighberhood Development Fund (NDF)
Capital Infrastructure Fund (CIF)
Municipal Aid Program (MAP)

- Paving Fund (PAV) i .
| Primary Sponsor: __Councilman Phillip 1. Baker I — B
" aie; Oclober 30,2024 ]

[Amoun: _ $6025.00 - tober 2
“B;:s{‘;ﬁ;ﬁ(;;ﬁ;)gram/projecl including: f)ublic fiin?posc, additional funding sources,
location of project/program and any external grantee(s):

ts intersection of Germantown,

Funding will be used to paint a mural at the Three Poin
Shelby Park and Schnitzelburg. :

City Agency: Louisville Metro Office of Arts + Creative Industries

Contact Person:  Jessica Kincaid

Agency Phone:  502-574-2064

I have reviewed this request for an expenditure of city tax dollars, and have
determined the funds will be used for a public purpose and have the attached
documentation from the receiving department concerning the project/expenditure.

,fﬂ‘A) . =Y
Ny ) (g e 2
6 J 7g\' s /Z_L 6025.00 10/30/2024

District # Council Membef Signature Amount Date

Approved by: ’5 /'</ég‘!57 M / /"/; ~2Y
: Appropriations C #mmittee Chairman Date

Clerk's Office & OMB Use Only:

Request Amount; M\ﬁnb, 09’6 Amended Amount:

Reference #: O - 25!-«[»'2&{ ToOMB:__ [} / );ﬁ] }':{

| Budget Revision #:

Account #:
To Project Manager: Completion Date:

Actual Cost: Funds Returned:
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Revised May 2016 ' l l!E [
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APPROPRIATION COMMITTEE CHAIR DATE




- Interagency Name:

Program/Project Name:

1 ouistille Metro Office of Arts ¢« Creative Industries

Neighborhood Mural: Three Points

: Request Form: 1s the Request Signed by all Council Member(s)
Appropriating Funding?

Request Form: 1 matching funds are to be used. are they disclosed with
~account numbers in the request form deseription?

" Request Form: 1 matching funds are to be used, does the amount of

“the request exclude the matching fund amount?

Request Form:  If other funds are to be used for this project, are they

~disclosed with account numbers in the request form description?

- Funding Source: 1{ CIF is being requested, does Metro Louisville

“own‘will own the real estate, building or equipment? If not, the
funding source is probably NDF.

- Funding Source: If CIF is being requested, does the project have a useful
life of more than one year? If not. the funding source is probably NDF.

Ordinance Required: Is the NDF request to a Metro Agency greater than

$5.000? If so, an ordinance is required.

- Ordinance Required: Is the re’q‘dérs't a transfer from NDF to cost center?

- 1f s0, is the amount given for the fiscal year $25,000 or less?

Supporting Documentation: Does the atachment include a valid
| estimate and description of cost?

Yes/No/NA
YES

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

N/A

YES |

Submitted by:

a2

- //Z’j N &

.’;{ . -
Anlhonyng/rdin, Legislative Assistant, District 6

i

Date: (9 30/20&‘7

Revised May 2016




WYLIE CAUDILL ART

Estimate

From

Wylie Caudill Art
info@wyliecaudilll.com
155 Ferndale Pass
Lexington, KY 40511
Phone:(859)954-1488

Description Rate

Louisville Mural Front $20 per square foot
Louisville Mural Side $15 per square foot

Payment Methods:

Square Link:
Check: Made out to Wylie Caudill or Wylie Caudill Art

To

Tony Hardin

Square Feet

155 f12
195 fi2

Subtotal

Tax (0%)
Total
Balance Due

October 21, 2024

Price

$3,100
$2,925

$6,025

$0.00
$6,025
$6,025




From: Kincaid, Jessica Jessica.Kincaid@Iouisvilleky.gov &
Subject: Re: Estimate
Date: October 30, 2024 at 2:44 PM
To: Hardin, Tony Tony.Hardin@Iouisvilleky.gov, Woodson, Wyatt Wyatt. Woodson@Iouisvilleky.gov
Cc: Martin, Nobie Nobie.Martin@louisvilleky.gov

Hi Tony,

Thanks for taking my call. The Office of Aris and Creative Industries will accept the funds for the mural project in D8.

1 will keep an eye out for the additional details we discussed that will need to include in the MOA between Metro, the Adist, and the
Property Owner.

Thank you,

Jessica

Jessica Bennett Kincaid

Director

Office of Arts + Creative Industries
Louisville Metro Government
502.574.3058

Sent from a mobile device

From: Hardin, Tony <Tony.Hardin @louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, October 30, 2024 2:30:48 PM

To: Woodson, Wyatt <Wyatt. Woodson@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid @louisvilleky.gov>; Martin, Nobie
<Nobie.Martin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: Estimate

Wyatt,
Great. We will be happy to provide those items.

Our rules require that your office respond stating that you are “willing to accept the funds.” Could you please do that?

Thanks,

Tony Hardin

Legislative Assistant

Office of Sixth District Counciiman Philiip T. Baker
Louisville Metro Council

Louisville City Hall

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
502-574-1106
tony.hardin@louisvilleky.gov

Follow Councilman Baker for Sixth District updates at www.facebook.com/CouncilmanPhillipBaker or on
Instagram @CouncilmaanlhpBaker




Subject: Fwd: Estimate
Date: October 21, 2024 at 2:51 PM
To: Kincaid, Jessica Jessica.Kincaid@Ilouisvilleky.gov

From: Hardin, Tony Tony.Hardin@Iouisvilleky.gov & @

Jessica,

Councilman Baker would like to have a building that is part of the Three Points area (where Germantown, Shelby Park, and
Schnitzelburg meet) painted with a public art mural.

Would your office be willing to process the payment to the artist (attached)?
Thanks,

Tony Hardin

Legislative Assistant

Office of Sixth District Councilman Phillip T. Baker
Louisville Metro Council

Louisville City Hall

601 West Jefferson Street
Louisville, Kentucky 40202
502-574-1106

tony hardin @louisviliehy.gov

Foliow Councilman Baker for Sixth District updates at www.facebook.com/CouncilmanPhillipBaker or on
Instagram @CouncilmanPhillipBaker

Begin forwarded message:

From: Wylie Caudill <nmifod wyliecaudith com>

Subject: Estimate

Date: October 21, 2024 at 2:43:31 PM EDT

To: "Hardin, Tony" <Tciy Haidmiouisvillehy.gov>

CAUTION: This email came from outside of Louisville Metro. Do not click links, open
attachments, or give away private information unless you recognize the sender's

email address and know the content is safe.

Estimate Attached




Golden, Amz

From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 2:.09 PM

To: Harward, Sonya; Golden, Amy

Cc Hardin, Tony; Baker, Phillip; Engel, Robin; Lewis, Christopher
Subject: FW: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - O-254-24
Attachments: Fwd Estimate.pdf

Please insert the attached email and below email in the 0-254-24 packet. Then this packet should move forward. Thank
you.

From: Hardin, Tony <Tony.Hardin@Iouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 2:00 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - 0-254-24

LaTonya,

On the email from October 21, Jessica Kincaid was out of office, so | follow-up on October 30 on the same email chain.

Thanks, Tony

On Nov 12, 2024, at 1:33 PM, Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Tony, please provide the email that reflects, Jessica Kincaid’s response to your attached October 21, 24
email. Then the attached Fwd Estimate.pdf and the other email will suffice. Thank you.

From: Baker, Phillip <Phillip.Baker@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 12:44 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Golden, Amy <Amy.Golden@louisvilleky.gov>;
Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>; Lewis, Christopher <Chris.Lewis louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - 0-254-24

That was done. See attached.

On Nov 12, 2024, at 12:42 PM, Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Beill2@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:
Good morning,

Please recall a detail scope of the project/program and cost estimate amount needs
to be referenced in the emails sent to the departments for acceptance. Thank you




From: Hardin, Tony <Tony.Hardin@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 11:51 AM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward @louisvilleky.gov>; Golden, Amy
<Amy.Golden@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Engel, Robin <Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>; Lewis,
Christopher <Chris.Lewis@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - 0-254-24

The email provided to Sonya should be sufficient. There is no Council rule that requires
the email have that exact wording.

On Nov 11, 2024, at 10:45 PM, Bell, LaTonya J.
<LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov> wrote:

Good evening again,

As Sonya implied below Filed ID# O-254-24 needs to be held at
the 11/12/24 Labor, Economic Development, and Appropriations
Committee meeting. Thank you.

Please address the below item as soon as possible. Thank you.

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Monday, November 11, 2024 3:25 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>; Baker, Phillip
<Phillip.Baker@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Hardin, Tony
<Tony.Hardin@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Golden, Amy <Amy.Golden@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - 0-254-24

FYl, | need amendments today in order for this item to be
heard tomorrow.

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonya Harward

Louisville Metro Council Clerk

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-2704 (direct)
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(502) 574-3902 (office)

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Beli2@louisvilieky.gov>
Sent: Wednesday, November 6, 2024 8:43 PM
To: Baker, Phillip <Phillip.Baker@louisvitleky.gov>; Hardin, Tony

<Tony.Hardin@louisvilleky.gov>
Cc: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Golden, Amy

<Amy.Golden@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: D06 - 11/12/24 Appropriation Committee - 0-254-24

Good evening,

Please address the below items by the end of the day on Friday,
November 8, 2024. Thank you.

7. 0-254-24 AN ORDINANCE APPROPRIATING $6,025 FROM DISTRICT 6 NEIGHI
DEVELOPMENT FUNDS TO THE LOUISVILLE METRO OFFICE OF ARTS + CREA
INDUSTRIES FOR A PUBLIC ART MURAL AT THE THREE POINTS INTERSECTIC

Sponsors: Phillip T. Baker (D-6)
Draft Comments: District 6 plans to allocate $6,025.00 NDF

Sfunds for a public art mural at the intersection of Germantown,
Shelby Park and Schnitzelburg.

D06 to address:
Supporting Documentation

The acceptance email in the NDF packet does not include the
$6,025.00 cost estimate amount, the location of where the mural
project will be place, or display any attachment(s) such as the
cost estimate. Please piggyback off the email from Jessica and
ask her to confirm the department will accept the $6,025.00 Wylie
Caudill Art cost estimate for the mural to be place in a public
location at xxxx.

Sidenote: Please recall a detail scope of the project/program and
cost estimate amount needs to be referenced in future emails sent
to the departments for acceptance. Thank you.




Harward, Sonza .

From: Kincaid, Jessica

Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 2:28 PM
To: Harward, Sonya

Subject: Re: Acceptance of Funds

Is there a filing deadline you are trying to meet? If so, | can get you a pretty quick confirmation if D6 has those details
handy.

Jessica Bennett Kincaid (she/her)
Director

Office of Arts + Creative Industries
Louisville Metro Government

444 S. Fifth St. #600, Louisville, KY 40202
0:502.574.3058

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Date: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 at 2:26 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: RE: Acceptance of Funds

Aww, good to know. Thank you! | was just trying to get this thing through but see we aren’t quite
clear just year. Thanks

Sonya Harward

Louisville Metro Council Clerk

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-2704 (direct)
- (502) 574-3902 (office)

From: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>
Sent: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 2:24 PM

To: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Re: Acceptance of Funds

Hi Sonya,

I actually just followed up with CM Baker's LA this morning requesting additional project details, but have not yet
received a response. I’m attaching the full email thread here. | did let the D6 office know that ’'m happy to accept the
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funds and support the project, but do still need specifics on the scope of what CM Baker intends to fund to ensure the
agreement with the artist and property owner is drafted accordingly.

Thanks,
Jessica

Jessica Bennett Kincaid (she/her)
Director

Office of Arts + Creative industries
Louisville Metro Government

444 S. Fifth St. #600, Louisville, KY 40202
0:502.574.3058

From: Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@Ilouisvilleky.gov>
Date: Tuesday, November 12, 2024 at 1:31 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid @louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: Acceptance of Funds

Jessica,
On behalf of CM Baker, please confirm that the department will accept the $6,025.00 Wylie Caudill Art

cost estimate for the mural to be place in a public location at the three points intersection of
Germantown, Shelby Park, and Schnitzelburg. See the packet where you initially accepted the funds,
but the details about what was being accepted was not stated.

Thanks,
Sonya

o PR A
A "

Sonya Harward

Louisville Metro Council Clerk

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-2704 (direct)
(502) 574-3902 (office)




ORDINANCE NO. 200 , SERIES 2024
AN ORDINANCE APPROPRIATING $6,025 FROM DISTRICT 6
NEIGHBORHOOD DEVELOPMENT FUNDS TO LOUISVILLE METRO
OFFICE OF ARTS + CREATIVE INDUSTRIES FOR COSTS

ASSOCIATED WITH A MURAL AT THE THREE POINTS
INTERSECTION.

SPONSORED BY: COUNCIL MEMBER BAKER

BE IT ORDAINED BY THE LEGISLATIVE COUNCIL OF THE
LOUISVILLE/JEFFERSON COUNTY METRO GOVERNMENT (“THE COUNCIL”) AS
FOLLOWS:

SECTION I: The sum of $6,025 is hereby appropriated from District 6
Neighborhood Development Funds to Louisville Metro Office of Arts + Creative
Industries for costs associated with a mural at the Three Points intersection.

SECTION Il: The Council has determined the funds requested in this
Ordinance will be expended for a public purpose.

SECTION lll:  This grant is subject to the Council’s Policies and Procedures as
adopted and effective at the date of passage of this Ordinance.

SECTION IV: This Ordinance shall take effect upon its passage and approval
or otherwise becoming law.

M0 HAE
) Markés Winkler

Sonya Hafwafd

Metro o&mci President of the Council
J1]24) 24
Craig Greenberg Approvdl Daté o)
Mayor
APPROIVEg AS TOHFORM AND LEGALITY:
“ﬂc';ffo J O’En°“”e e LOUISVILLE METRO COUNCIL
Jefferson Sounly Afomey READ AND PASSED

or (Ll Uzoncher 2292

0-254-




METRO COUNCIL - CLERK'S OFFICE
NEIGHBORHOOD DEVELOPMENT FUND

ORGANIZATION NAME: Louisvill Metro Office of Arts + Creative Industries
TOTAL AMOUNT
APPROPRIATED: $6,025.00
DATE APPROPRIATION
APPROVED: 11/21/2024
DISTRICT: AMOUNT: ACCOUNT:

1103-105 1ST DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT

1

2 1103-105 2ND DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
3 1103-105 3RD DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
4 1103-105 4TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
5 1103-105 5TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
6 $6,025.00 |1103-105 6TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
7 1103-105 7TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
8 1103-105 8TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
9 1103-105 9TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
10 1103-105 10TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
11 1103-105 11TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
12 1103-105 12TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
13 1103-105 13TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
14 1103-105 14TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-8939001-RESTRICTED ACCT
15 1103-105 15TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
16 1103-105 16TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
17 1103-105 17TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
18 1103-105 18TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
19 1103-105 19TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
20 1103-105 20TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
21 1103-105 21ST DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
22 1103-105 22ND DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
23 1103-105 23RD DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
24 1103-105 24TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT
25 1103-105 25TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT

1103-105 26TH DISTRICT NEIGHORHOOD DEVELOPMENT-899001-RESTRICTED ACCT




Conder, Nicholas

—— S
From: Lyninger, JP

Sent: Thursday, March 27, 2025 3:27 PM

To: Conder, Nicholas

Subject: Request for Ordinance

Our office is seeking an ordinance to rescind Ordinance No. 254, Series 2024 appropriating $6,025 from
District 6 Neighborhood Development Funds to the Office of Arts and Creative Industries for a public art
mural at the Three Points intersection. This ordinance is necessary due to lack of information in the
Louisville Metro Council Originated NDF paperwork pertaining to the original appropriation; the
ordinance did not provide enough specifics about the mural's location, despite requests to do so from
Council staff and the Office of Arts and Creative Industries. This has resulted in an inability to match the
planned artwork with a property owner, meaning that the project cannot be carried out, which led to a
recommendation from the Office of Arts and Creative Industries to rescind the ordinance and re-submit
if and when there are more detailed plans for a mural.

Solidarity,
JP Lyninger

Councilman JP Lyninger

Louisville Metro Council District 6

601 W. Jefferson Street | Louisville, KY 40202

p: (502) 574-1106 e: jp.lyninger@louisvilleky.gov




Conder, Nicholas

I — A TR
From: Harward, Sonya
Sent: Wednesday, March 19, 2025 10:17 AM
To: Conder, Nicholas; Bell, LaTonya J.
Cc: Lyninger, JP; Stenberg, Beth
Subject: RE: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art
Mural
Follow Up Flag: Follow up
Flag Status: Flagged

Councilman Lyninger and Nick,
Will you all be requesting that OMB draft the legislation to rescind these funds?

Thanks,
Sonya

Sonya Harwa rol

Louisville Metro Council Clerk

601 W. Jefferson Street, Ste. 103
Louisville, KY 40202
(502) 574-2704 (direct)
(502) 574-3902 (office)

From: Conder, Nicholas <nicholas.conder@I|ouisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Thursday, February 20, 2025 12:32 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@!ouisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lyninger, JP <jp.lyninger@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@Ilouisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Jessica,

After speaking with Councilman Lyninger, our office agrees with your assessment that the easiest and cleanest solution
here would be to return the funds to the D6 account. In the future, if we can coordinate with other involved parties
better and document that, maybe some other project could take place, but as of now, it doesn’t seem clear from the
available information that we know enough to proceed with the project.

Thank you,

Nick Conder

Legislative Assistant

Louisville Metro Council District 6
Office: 502-574-3910 | Cell: 502-408-8066




nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov

From: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Wednesday, February 19, 2025 6:05 PM

To: Conder, Nicholas <nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2 @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lyninger, JP <jp.lyninger@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya
<Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Hi Nick,

Thanks for reaching out about this, and for your patience on my reply.

Unfortunately, | didn’t receive much information beyond what you have outlined below. [t’s not clear where this
request originated, how the artist was selected, or how far into project development Councilman Baker or his staff
may have gotten with residents and/or the property owner. | did notice that the property owner identified in the
attached email from Tony Hardin on Jan 6 (Red Top Gourmet Hot Dogs/Rail Line Food Yard) didn’t directly match
the property owner as listed on Lojic (D&S, Investment LLC). | believe D&S may be affiliated with the Abell Elevator
Co., which is located across the street.

No one has reached out to my office to inquire about the status of the project, but I'm not sure who might still have
outstanding expectations or if this was already publicly promised to neighbors. | am willing to work through this
however D6 prefers, but my current thinking is that it would be cleanest for the funds to be returned to the D6
office and if CM Lyninger is interested to support a mural project in the future, we could start the process afresh
with clearer scope and better documentation.

How does this sound to you?

Best,
Jessica

Jessica Bennett Kincaid (she/her)
Director

Office of Arts + Creative Industries
Louisville Metro Government

444 S, Fifth St. #600, Louisville, KY 40202
0:502.574.3058

From: Conder, Nicholas <nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: Wednesday, February 12, 2025 at 4:31 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>, Bell, LaTonya J.
<LaTonya.Beli2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lyninger, JP <jp.lyninger@louisvilleky.gov>, Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>,
Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Jessica,

I wanted to follow up about this NDF for the mural at Three Points. What documentation would you need from the
District 6 office to correct these issues, and for that matter, are they even correctable at this point? We were not even
given correct information from the previous office about who owns the property and nowhere in the documents do they
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actually list which property the mural is supposed to be painted on. Our guess is that it is 1257 Logan St from a picture
associated with the estimate from the artist, but the person that Tony Hardin told us owns the building does not own
that property. We are happy to help in whatever way we can in getting this cleaned up.

Thank you,

Nick Conder

Legislative Assistant

Louisville Metro Council District 6
Office: 502-574-3910 | Cell: 502-408-8066
nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov

From: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, January 21, 2025 1:02 PM

To: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lyninger, JP <jp.lyninger@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Conder, Nicholas <nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg, Beth
<Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

HiLaTonya,

Thanks for your patience on my reply. The Office of Arts + Creative Industries did not receive any additional
documentation from CM Baker’s office prior to the end of the year and, therefore, no contract was executed with
the artist. If this project is something that CM Lyninger is interested to pursue further, | will be happy to work with
the D6 office. If not, please let me know what action is required on my end to return the funds.

Thanks, again, for your continued assistance on this.

Best,
Jessica

Jessica Bennett Kincaid (she/her)
Director

Office of Arts + Creative Industries
Louisville Metro Government

4445, Fifth St. #600, Louisville, KY 40202
0:502.574.3058

From: Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>

Date: Friday, January 17, 2025 at 1:47 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Lyninger, JP <jp.lyninger@louisvilleky.gov>, Conder, Nicholas <nicholas.conder@louisvilleky.gov>,
Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>, Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>
Subject: FW: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Good afternoon,

Director Kincaid, I'm following up on the below and attached emails. Did Office of Arts & Creative Industries
receive the requested information/documents by the period requested? Also, has the artist contract been
executed? Please advise.




Thank you,

LaTonya

From: Bell, LaTonya J.

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 10:22 PM

To: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid @louisvilleky.gov>; Vincent, Ashley <Ashley.Vincent3 @louisvilleky.gov>; Hardin,
Tony <Tony.Hardin@louisvilleky.gov>; Lyddane, Briana <Briana.Lyddane @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Steele, Roxanne <Roxanne.Steele@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg, Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward,
Sonya <Sonya.Harward @louisvilleky.gov>; Taylor, Ebony <ebony.taylor@louisvilleky.gov>; Robinson, Justin
<Justin.Robinson@louisvilleky.gov>; Baker, Phillip <Phillip.Baker@louisvilleky.gov>; Engel, Robin
<Robin.Engel@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: RE: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Good evening,

Attached is the email listing the information requested by the Office of Arts & Creative Industries. Please recall if the
attached items are not addressed by the current District 6 LA prior to Council member Baker leaving office, then the NDF
funds will be returned to D06’s NDF account for the new District 6 Council member to reallocate the funds to other NDF
projects as needed.

Thank you,

LaTonya

From: Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 3:49 PM

To: Vincent, Ashley <Ashley.Vincent3@Iouisvilleky.gov>; Hardin, Tony <Tony.Hardin@louisvilleky.gov>; Lyddane, Briana
<Briana.Lyddane @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Steele, Roxanne <Roxanne.Steele@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg,
Beth <Beth.Stenberg@louisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Taylor, Ebony
<ebony.taylor@louisvilleky.gov>; Robinson, Justin <Justin.Robinson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: Re: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Thank you, Ashley.
@Hardin, Tony I'll follow up with you in a separate thread about the outstanding project details.

Jessica Bennett Kincaid (she/her)
Director

Office of Arts + Creative industries
Louisville Metro Government

444 S. Fifth St. #600, Louisville, KY 40202
0:502.574.3058

Sent from a mobile device




From: Vincent, Ashley <Ashley.Vincent3@louisvilieky gov>

Sent: Tuesday, December 17, 2024 3:45:40 PM

To: Hardin, Tony <Tony.Hardin@Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Kincaid, Jessica <Jessica.Kincaid@louisvilleky.gov>; Lyddane, Briana
<Briana.Lyddane @louisvilleky.gov>

Cc: Steele, Roxanne <Roxanne.Steele@louisvilleky.gov>; Bell, LaTonya J. <LaTonya.Bell2@louisvilleky.gov>; Stenberg,
Beth <Beth.Stenberg®Ilouisvilleky.gov>; Harward, Sonya <Sonya.Harward@louisvilleky.gov>; Taylor, Ebony
<ebony.taylor@louisvilleky.gov>; Robinson, Justin <justin.Robinson@louisvilleky.gov>

Subject: NDF - Appropriating $6,025 FROM D06 TO Economic Development FOR Public Art Mural

Hi,

Please see the attached budget amendment (BUDA00003836).

Thanks,

Ashley Vincent

Budget Planning Analyst

Louisville Metro Government

Office of Management and Budget

% 502-574-7122 B www.louisvilleky.gov

1 ashley.vincent3@louisvilleky.gov |¥ 611 W. Jefferson Street ¢ Louisville, KY 40202




